
Uncover the Thrilling World of Team Alpha:
Iniquus Security Action Adventure Boxed Set
Attention all adventure enthusiasts and fans of action-packed storytelling!
Get ready to embark on a heart-pounding journey into the captivating world
of Team Alpha with the Iniquus Security Action Adventure Boxed Set. This
collection offers an adrenaline-fueled experience, packed with danger,
suspense, and a group of elite operatives determined to protect the world
from imminent threats.

In today's chaotic world, maintaining security has become a paramount
concern. Whether it's defending against global terrorism, thwarting cyber
attacks, or uncovering dangerous conspiracies, an exceptional team of
skilled professionals is vital to preserving peace and stability. And that's
where Team Alpha steps in.
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Featuring six thrilling novels, the Team Alpha Boxed Set introduces readers
to a group of remarkable individuals, each with their unique set of skills and
backgrounds. From former military operatives to expert hackers and
brilliant strategists, every member brings something valuable to the team,
ensuring an unstoppable force against any threat that dares to challenge
them.

1. Iniquus

The journey into this high-octane adventure begins with "Iniquus." Follow
the team as they race against time to uncover a sinister plot that threatens
to plunge the world into chaos. With danger lurking around every corner,
experience heart-stopping action sequences intertwined with elements of
espionage, intensifying the suspense with each page turned.

As the team delves deeper into a web of deception and treachery, their
skills, quick thinking, and unbreakable bond are put to the ultimate test.
Blending cutting-edge technology with pulse-pounding action, "Iniquus" will
leave readers breathless, craving more of Team Alpha's gripping
escapades.

2. Solus
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The second installment in the series, "Solus," plunges readers into a race
against a faceless enemy desperate to unleash devastation on an
unimaginable scale. As the team must confront their darkest fears and
personal demons, the stakes skyrocket, pushing the boundaries of their
abilities to new heights.

From politically charged conflicts to covert operations in exotic locations,
"Solus" delivers an immersive experience that will ignite the readers'
imagination. Brace yourself for jaw-dropping plot twists and heart-
wrenching moments as Team Alpha battles to protect innocent lives and
save the world from imminent catastrophe.

3. Fortis

In "Fortis," the third installment of the series, the team faces its most
formidable adversary yet. A dangerous organization threatens to unleash a
devastating biological weapon capable of wiping out millions. With time
running out, Team Alpha must push their limits like never before as they
navigate through deadly traps, secret laboratories, and a web of corruption.

This action-packed novel showcases the true strength of friendship and
teamwork when faced with almost insurmountable odds. Prepare for an
emotional rollercoaster ride as they fight for justice, sacrificing everything to
prevent the unimaginable from becoming a horrifying reality.

4. Invictus

Get ready for an explosive revelation in "Invictus." The fourth book in the
series unearths a sinister conspiracy that threatens even the most powerful
governments. Corruption and betrayal run deep as Team Alpha unravels a
tangled web of deceit, all while keeping one step ahead of their enemies.



With high-stakes missions and heart-pounding chases, "Invictus" will keep
readers on the edge of their seats. This installment explores the intricate
dynamics of trust and loyalty within the team, testing their resolve as they
confront dangerous dilemmas that could shatter their unity.

5. Audax

"Audax," the penultimate installment of the series, propels readers into the
chaotic world of international arms trafficking. Deep undercover missions,
adrenaline-fueled encounters, and intricate power struggles await as Team
Alpha races against time and a cunning enemy.

Filled with pulse-pounding action sequences and unforgettable characters,
"Audax" offers thrilling escapades that will leave readers breathless,
craving the explosive climax to come.

6. Tenax

The epic to the Iniquus Security team series, "Tenax," promises an
unrelenting battle against an organization that seeks to unleash chaos on a
global scale. Team Alpha must utilize all their training, skill, and
unbreakable spirit in a final showdown that will determine the fate of
humanity.

With heart-stopping action, unexpected betrayals, and thrilling plot twists,
"Tenax" will leave readers captivated until the last page. This extraordinary
finale wraps up the series, providing a satisfying to the exhilarating world of
Team Alpha.

Whether you are a fan of action, suspense, or intricate conspiracies, the
Team Alpha Boxed Set Iniquus Security Action Adventure Boxed Set is an



absolute must-read. Dive into this thrilling collection and get ready for the
pulse-pounding adventures of an elite group dedicated to protecting the
world from darkness.

Don't miss out on this incredible journey - grab your copy of the Team Alpha
Boxed Set Iniquus Security Action Adventure Boxed Set today, and prepare
to be hooked from the very first page!
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Ex-Special Operators join the Cerberus Iniquus Tactical K9 Team Alpha
with three action adventure novels

Survival Instinct

Military training won’t help when the enemy is a force of nature…

All Major Dani Addams wanted when she started up that trail was to mourn
and honor her fallen friend. She has no way of knowing the weather is
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about to turn on her in the worst possible way—or that she's about to meet
a man who will change her entire life.

Ex-SEAL Trip Williams and his K9 Valor were brought in to rescue a film
crew that got caught in the storm. He isn’t expecting Dani. But once he
finds her, he will keep her safe…even if he has to disobey direct orders and
fight Mother Nature herself.

All Dani and Trip have to do to get to happily ever after is weather the
storm. Should be simple, right? If only…

Protective Instinct

He can protect her…but only if he can earn her trust first…

Artist Harper Katz was in the wrong place at the wrong time and heard
something she really shouldn’t have. Now, she’s on the run with a killer on
her trail. Her only option is to lay low until she can get out of the country.
She can’t afford to trust anyone—no matter how much she wishes she
could.

Ex-Delta Force Operator Ridge Hansen has had a thing for Harper for a
long time. So has his tactical K9, Zeus. But persuading Harper to move
their relationship from friends to lovers has been tough. He’ll still protect her
from…whoever is after her. All he has to do is convince Harper to let him.

Ridge will have to use every skill and protective instinct he has to keep the
woman of his dreams alive. He can only hope it’ll be enough to get them



both safely to happily ever after…

Defender's Instinct

It’ll take more than his battle-hardened instincts to defend her…

CIA linguist Sabrin Harris’s plans for a relaxing vacation went up in smoke
when twenty-six hostages disappeared just north of her grandmother’s
house in Slovakia. Now, she’s been called into action. Her mission is fairly
simple. Not allowing herself to be distracted by the hot-as-sin ex-Australian
Commando who’s sent in to help and defend her will be infinitely more
difficult.

Iniquus Security operative Ryder Kelly remembers Sabrin as the beautiful
woman his dog picked out of the crowd at a tactical K9 competition. When
they’re assigned to work together, Ryder soon realizes he could fall for her
just as easily as his dog Voodoo did. So, all he has to do now is keep
Sabrin alive long enough to get to their happily ever after. Easy, right?

Their timing is all wrong. Romance was never part of the plan. But with
enemies closing in, the fragile bond Sabrin and Ryder have formed might
be all that allows them to save the day—and each other.

Defender's Instinct is an intense, strangers-to-lovers, action adventure
military romantic suspense filled with spies, conspiracies, and international
terror.

Ready for an adventure? Grab your copy, and let's go!
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